

November 20, 2019

On Wednesday November 20, 2019 at 9:00 a.m., the Police Jury of Sabine Parish, State of Louisiana met in open and regular session.

The Agenda was as follows:

1. Call to Order
2. Roll Call
3. Prayer
4. Pledge of Allegiance
5. Amend the Agenda
6. Adopt the Agenda
7. Public Comments
8. Accept the Minutes of the Previous Meeting, October 16, 2019
9. Planning Commission
- 9(a). Discuss the Purchase of the Converse Ball Park
10. Reappoint Roberta Vhoories as Board Member (Tenant Representative) on the Sabine Parish Housing Authority
11. Authorize the Application for an LGAP Grant to Improve the New Compactor Site Located in Ward 3
12. Authorize Sabine Parish Waterworks District No. 1 to Apply for a 2019-2020 Community Water Enrichment Fund (CWEF) Grant
13. Adopt a Resolution Formally Creating and Establishing a Regional Steering Committee (RSC) for Region Four (4) – Parishes of Allen, Beauregard, Calcasieu, Cameron, Desoto, Jeff Davis, Rapides, Sabine, and Vernon; and Authorizing the RSC to Act on Their Behalf
14. Adopt a Resolution Approving an Agreement with the Northwest Louisiana Council of Governments (NLCOG), the Coordination and Development Corporation (CDC), and the LSUS Red River Watershed Management Institute for the Purpose of Applying for Grant Funding and Acting in Support of Watershed Region Management Activities and in Conjunction with the State of Louisiana Watershed Initiative (Region 1)
15. Appoint a Steering Committee Member for Region 1
16. Approve the Transfer of \$33,000 From the General Fund to the Criminal Court Fund
17. Approve Closing Four Bank Accounts and Transferring the Balances to the Sabine State Bank Money Market Account
18. 2020 Bids for Materials, Supplies, and Services – Take Under Advisement (Opened 11/6/19)
19. Set Date and Time for Public Hearing on Proposed Budget for Fiscal Year Ended December 31, 2020
20. Parish Transportation Act Priority List (3 Years – 2020,2021, 2022)- Reminder Only
21. Authorize Payment of Approved Bills
22. Appropriate Sales Tax for November Operations (\$230,000)
23. Committee Reports
24. Operations
25. Adjournment

1. Call to Order

President Ronald L. Bison called the meeting to order.

2. Roll Call

The roll was called by the Secretary Treasurer. The following jurors were present: Willes Funderburk, Mike McCormic, “Charlie” Brown, William E. Ruffin, “Ronny” Bison, Eric Garcie, Ricky ”K-Wall” Sepulvado, Kenneth M. Ebarb, and “Randy” Byrd.

3. Prayer

Prayer was led by Mr. Kenneth M. Ebarb.

4. Pledge of Allegiance

The Pledge of Allegiance was led by Mr. Charlie Brown.

5. Amend the Agenda

Public comments on the motion to amend the agenda were allowed prior to any vote to add an item to the agenda. There were no comments.

Resolution No. 8410

Motion by Ebarb and seconded by Garcie to amend the agenda to include the following items:

Item 9(a) – Discuss the Purchase of the Converse Ball Park.

This resolution having been submitted to a vote; the vote thereon was as follows:

Yeas: 9 - Funderburk, McCormic, Ruffin, Bison, Brown, Garcie, Sepulvado, Ebarb, and Byrd

Nays: 0

Abstain: 0

Absent: 0

6. Adopt the Agenda

Resolution No. 8411

Motion by Sepulvado and seconded by Brown to adopt the agenda as amended.

This resolution having been submitted to a vote; the vote thereon was as follows:

Yeas: 9 - Funderburk, McCormic, Ruffin, Bison, Brown, Garcie, Sepulvado, Ebarb, and Byrd

Nays: 0

Abstain: 0

Absent: 0

7. Public Comments

Police Jury President, Ronald L. Bison, allowed a period of public comment on any item on the agenda. Mr. Bison advised everyone that they would be allowed to comment later during the meeting on particular agenda items, if they desire.

Mr. Jeff Davidson addressed the police jury concerning storm water drainage on Shamrock Road.

8. Accept the Minutes of the Previous Meeting, October 16, 2019

All police jurors have previously been provided written copies of the minutes of the regular meeting held on October 16, 2019.

Resolution No. 8412

Motion by Ruffin and seconded by Byrd to accept the minutes of the regular meeting held on October 16, 2019.

This resolution having been submitted to a vote; the vote thereon was as follows:

Yeas: 9 - Funderburk, McCormic, Ruffin, Bison, Brown, Garcie, Sepulvado, Ebarb, and Byrd

Nays: 0

Abstain: 0

Absent: 0

**9. Planning Commission**

No member of the Sabine Parish Planning Commission was present at the meeting.

**9(a). Discuss the Purchase of the Converse Ballpark**

Mr. Sepulvado informed the police jury that Mrs. Paul has allowed the Dixie Youth Baseball to use approximately 9.27 acres of her land for a ballpark for several years. However, Mrs. Paul is now deceased, and the land is for sale with an appraised value of \$ 70,975. Mr. Sepulvado described the facilities and expressed his belief that the park would be a great asset for the community.

Secretary Treasurer Weatherford was instructed to research the possible purchase of this property and to contact Mr. Don Burkett for legal guidance.

Resolution No. 8413

Motion by Sepulvado and seconded by Garcie to table consideration of the purchase of the Converse Ballpark until the next meeting.

This resolution having been submitted to a vote; the vote thereon was as follows:

Yeas: 9 - Funderburk, McCormic, Ruffin, Bison, Brown, Garcie, Sepulvado, Ebarb, and Byrd

Nays: 0

Abstain: 0

Absent: 0

**10. Reappoint Roberta Vhoories as Board Member (Tenant Representative) on the Sabine Parish Housing Authority**

On October 24<sup>th</sup> the Police Jury received a request from the Sabine Parish Housing Authority to reappoint Ms. Roberta Vhoories as a board member (tenant representative).

Resolution No. 8414

Motion by Ruffin and seconded by Ebarb;

WHEREAS, on August 21, 2019 the Police Jury appointed Ms. Roberta Vhoories as a tenant board member to complete Ms. Emma Wysinger's term (Resolution No. 8363), and

WHEREAS, the term of appointment ended November 18, 2019, and

WHEREAS, the Sabine Parish Housing Authority has requested that the police jury reappoint Ms. Roberta Vhoories as a board member (tenant representative).

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that Ms. Roberta Vhoories is hereby appointed as a board member (tenant representative) of the Sabine Parish Housing Authority with her term expiring November 18, 2024.

This resolution having been submitted to a vote; the vote thereon was as follows:

Yeas: 9 - Funderburk, McCormic, Ruffin, Bison, Brown, Garcie, Sepulvado, Ebarb, and Byrd

Nays: 0

Abstain: 0

Absent: 0

11. Authorize the Application for an LGAP Grant to Improve the New Compactor Site Located in Ward 3

The 2019-2020 Local Government Assistance Program (LGAP) grant applications are now available and must be completed and received by the Office of Community Development no later than December 6<sup>th</sup>, 2019.

Mr. McCormic requested the police jury to support and authorize the preparation and filing of an LGAP grant application in the amount of \$100,000 to improve the new compactor site located in Ward 3 (the Worm Factory compactor site).

Resolution No. 8415

Motion by McCormic and seconded by Ebarb;

WHEREAS, Local Government Assistance (LGAP) grants are now available for the 2019-2020 year, and

WHEREAS, applications for LGAP grants must be received by the Office of Community Development no later than December 6, 2019, and

WHEREAS, the police jury desires to apply for a LGAP grant to make improvements to a new compactor site located in Ward 3.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Sabine Parish Police Jury fully supports and hereby authorizes its grant writer to prepare an application for a 2019-2020 LGAP Grant to make improvements to a new compactor site located in Ward 3, and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that President Bison be hereby authorized to execute any documents necessary to make the application for the LGAP Grant.

This resolution having been submitted to a vote; the vote thereon was as follows:

Yeas: 9 - Funderburk, McCormic, Ruffin, Bison, Brown, Garcie, Sepulvado, Ebarb, and Byrd

Nays: 0

Abstain: 0

Absent: 0

12. Authorize Sabine Parish Waterworks District No. 1 to Apply for a 2019-2020 Community Water Enrichment Fund (CWEF) Grant

Mr. Walter Mains, President of the Sabine Parish Waterworks District No. 1 addressed the police jury. He requested the police jury to approve and authorize the District to apply for a 2019-2020 Community Water Enrichment Fund (CWEF) Grant in the amount of one hundred thousand dollars (\$100,000). The grant will be used to extend water service towards Marthaville along Highway 1217 and Rocky Springs Road.

Resolution No. 8416

Motion by Ruffin and seconded by Brown;

WHEREAS, the Sabine Parish Waterworks District No. 1 has a need for improvements to its system, and

WHEREAS, the Sabine Parish Waterworks District No.1 has insufficient unappropriated funds on hand for the required capital improvement project, and

WHEREAS, the proposed project shall provide potable water service to numerous rural residences along Marthaville Road,

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESSOLVED, in accordance with the requirements of the Community Water Enrichment Fund Program, the Sabine Parish Police Jury does hereby support and grant authorization to execute and submit an application for the 2019-2020 Community Water Enrichment Fund Program (CWEF) Grant in the amount of one hundred thousand dollars (\$100,000), and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that Ronald L. Bison, as Police Jury President, be and he is hereby authorized to sign the application, contract, and all Requests for Payment or other documents required by the Community Water Enrichment Fund Program (CWEF).

This resolution having been submitted to a vote; the vote thereon was as follows:

Yeas: 9 - Funderburk, McCormic, Ruffin, Bison, Brown, Garcie, Sepulvado, Ebarb, and Byrd

Nays: 0

Abstain: 0

Absent: 0

13. Adopt a Resolution Formally Creating and Establishing a Regional Steering Committee (RSC) for Region Four (4) – Parishes of Allen, Beauregard, Calcasieu, Cameron, Desoto, Jeff Davis, Rapides, Sabine, and Vernon; and Authorizing the RSC to Act on Their Behalf

Resolution No. 8417

**Resolution Formally Creating and Establishing a Regional Steering Committee (RSC) for Region Four (4) – Parishes of Allen, Beauregard, Calcasieu, Cameron, Desoto, Jeff Davis, Rapides, Sabine, and Vernon; and Authorizing the RSC to Act on Their Behalf**

Motion by Sepulvado and seconded by Byrd;

WHEREAS, the Louisiana Watershed Initiative was formed in order to coordinate statewide floodplain management efforts through a watershed management approach in response to the 2016 Great Floods and in preparation for future storm and flood events; and

WHEREAS, this initiative includes outreach with local communities to build support for watershed region management activities; and

WHEREAS, coordination among all Parishes in Region Four (4) is critical to reducing flood risk and preserving the health, safety, and welfare of the residents of all Parishes in Region Four (4); and

WHEREAS, the Louisiana Watershed Initiative has requested applications for participation in a Regional Capacity Building Grant Program, which may enable the provision of technical assistance to the Parishes in Region Four (4); and

WHEREAS, action is now necessary to organize the Regional Steering Committee for Region Four (4) in order to structure the affairs for its meetings and business.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the Parishes in Region Four (4) hereby agree as follows:

- 1) That a Cooperative Endeavor Agreement be entered by and between Allen Parish Police Jury, Beauregard Parish Police Jury, Calcasieu Parish Police Jury, Cameron Parish Police Jury, DeSoto Parish Police Jury, Jeff Davis Parish Police Jury, Rapides Parish Police Jury, Sabine Parish Police Jury, and Vernon Parish Police Jury, for the purpose of establishing a Regional Steering Committee comprised of said Parishes and providing for the appointment structure, for the purpose of :
  - a. Guiding and advising of grant funding; and
  - b. Supporting the watershed region management activities in conjunction with the State of Louisiana Watershed Initiative, and any other activities related thereto.
  - c. Appointing Mr. William E. Ruffin as the Sabine Parish Police Jury representative on the Region Four (4) Regional Steering Committee.
  
- 2) That a Cooperative Endeavor Agreement be entered by and between the Regional Steering Committee, on behalf of said Parishes in Region Four (4), and the Calcasieu Parish Police Jury, for the purpose of:
  - a. The Calcasieu Parish Police Jury serving as fiscal agent relative to funding, including grant funding, received as a part of the State of Louisiana Watershed Initiative; and
  - b. Supporting the watershed region management activities in conjunction with the State of Louisiana Watershed Initiative, and any other activities related thereto.

This resolution having been submitted to a vote; the vote thereon was as follows:

Yeas: 9 - Funderburk, McCormic, Ruffin, Bison, Brown, Garcie, Sepulvado, Ebarb, and Byrd

Nays: 0

Abstain: 0

Absent: 0

14. Adopt a Resolution Approving an Agreement with the Northwest Louisiana Council of Governments (NLCOG), the Coordination and Development Corporation (CDC), and the LSUS Red River Watershed Management Institute for the Purpose of Applying for Grant Funding and Acting in Support of Watershed Region Management Activities and in Conjunction with the State of Louisiana Watershed Initiative (Region 1)

Resolution No. 8418

**A Resolution Approving an Agreement with the Northwest Louisiana Council of Governments (NLCOG), the Coordination and Development Corporation (CDC), and the LSUS Red River Watershed Management Institute for the Purpose of Applying for Grant Funding and Acting in Support of Watershed Region Management Activities and in Conjunction with the State of Louisiana Watershed Initiative (Region 1)**

Motion by Sepulvado and seconded by Byrd:

WHEREAS, the Louisiana Watershed Initiative was formed in order to coordinate statewide floodplain management efforts through a watershed management approach in response to the 2016 Great Floods and in preparation for future storm and flood events. This coordination includes outreach with local communities to build support for watershed region management approaches that can more effectively address mounting water risks statewide; and

WHEREAS, coordination among the Sabine Parish Police Jury and its regional partners is critical to reducing flood risk and preserving the health, safety, and welfare of the residents of Sabine Parish; and

WHEREAS, the Louisiana Watershed Initiative has requested applications for participation in a Regional Capacity Building Grant Program, which may enable the provision of technical assistance to the Sabine Parish Police Jury and its regional partners, if awarded, thereby furthering immediate watershed management and flood risk reduction goals.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the agreement between the Sabine Parish Police Jury and the Northwest Louisiana Council of Governments (NLCOG), the Coordination and Development Corporation (CDC), and the LSUS Red River Watershed Management Institute, for the purpose of applying for grant funding and acting in support of watershed region management activities and in conjunction with the State of Louisiana Watershed Initiative is hereby approved.

This resolution having been submitted to a vote; the vote thereon was as follows:

Yeas: 9 - Funderburk, McCormic, Ruffin, Bison, Brown, Garcie, Sepulvado, Ebarb, and Byrd

Nays: 0

Abstain: 0

Absent: 0

15. Appoint a Steering Committee Member for Region 1

The Sabine Parish Police Jury is required to appoint a representative on the Region One (1) Regional Steering Committee for the State of Louisiana Watershed Initiative.

Resolution No. 8419

Motion by McCormic and seconded by Brown to appoint Mr. William E. Ruffin as the representative for the Sabine Parish Police Jury on the Region One (1) Regional Steering Committee for the State of Louisiana Watershed Initiative.

This resolution having been submitted to a vote; the vote thereon was as follows:

Yeas: 9 - Funderburk, McCormic, Ruffin, Bison, Brown, Garcie, Sepulvado, Ebarb, and Byrd

Nays: 0

Abstain: 0

Absent: 0

16. Approve the Transfer of \$33,000 From the General Fund to the Criminal Court Fund

The Criminal Court Fund currently has a deficit fund balance. The Secretary Treasurer recommends that \$33,000 be transferred from the General Fund to the Criminal Court Fund to pay the expected expenditures of the fund in excess of its dedicated revenues.

Resolution No. 8420

Motion by Ruffin and seconded by Byrd to approve and authorize the transfer of \$33,000 from the General Fund to the Criminal Court Fund.

This resolution having been submitted to a vote; the vote thereon was as follows:

Yeas: 9 - Funderburk, McCormic, Ruffin, Bison, Brown, Garcie, Sepulvado, Ebarb, and Byrd

Nays: 0

Abstain: 0

Absent: 0

17. Approve Closing Four Bank Accounts and Transferring the Balances to the Sabine State Bank Money Market Account

To simplify the Sabine Parish Police Jury's accounting process, the Secretary Treasurer recommends closing four (4) existing bank accounts and transferring the account balances to an existing money market account with Sabine State Bank.

Resolution No. 8421

Motion by Ruffin and seconded by Garcie to approve and authorize the closing of the following four (4) bank accounts:

- Sabine State Bank Payroll Account
- Hancock Whitney Master Account
- Sabine State Bank General Fund
- Hancock Whitney Money Markey Account

and transferring the bank balances to the Sabine State Bank Money Market Account.

This resolution having been submitted to a vote; the vote thereon was as follows:

Yeas: 9 - Funderburk, McCormic, Ruffin, Bison, Brown, Garcie, Sepulvado, Ebarb, and Byrd

Nays: 0

Abstain: 0

Absent: 0

18. 2020 Bids for Materials, Supplies, and Services – Take Under Advisement (Opened 11/6/19)

Sealed bids were received in the Police Jury Office, at the Courthouse, Many, Louisiana, until 10:00 a.m. on November 6, 2019 for 2020 materials, supplies, and services at which time they were opened and read aloud. The bid advertisement stated that the bids would be presented to the Police Jury today, Wednesday, November 20, 2019 during the regularly scheduled meeting and then would be taken under advisement. The bids will be reviewed and awarded on December 18, 2019. The Secretary Treasurer has provided the Jurors and Road Superintendent Hughes a copy of all bids opened along with the bid tabulation. The bid tabulation is as follows:

**BID TABULATION – 2020**

**1. Hot Mix**

(a) <u>Prairie Contractors, LLC</u>	
Hot Mix – FOB Leesville Plant	\$76.00 per ton
(b) <u>Madden Contracting Company, LLC.</u>	
Hot Mix – FOB Natchitoches Plant	\$72.00 per ton
Hot Mix – FOB Shreveport Plant	\$72.00 per ton
(c) <u>East Texas Asphalt Co. Ltd.</u>	
Hot Mix – FOB Center, TX Plant	\$78.00 per ton
Hot Mix- Delivered to Many, LA	\$90.20 per ton
Hot Mix- FOB Lufkin, TX Plant	\$75.00 per ton
Hot Mix- Delivered to Many, LA	\$89.20 per ton

2. **Oil Sand Mix (Oil Dirt)**
  - (a) East Texas Asphalt Co. Ltd.

Oil Sand – FOB Center, TX Plant	\$65.00 per ton
Oil Sand – Delivered to Many, LA	\$77.20 per ton
Oil Sand – FOB Lufkin, TX Plant	\$65.00 per ton
Oil Sand – Delivered to Many, LA	\$79.20 per ton
Oil Sand – FOB Rebecca, TX Plant	\$70.00 per ton
Oil Sand – Delivered to Many, LA	\$79.20 per ton
  
3. **Hot Mix/Oil Sand Mix Installation with Lay Down Machine**
  - (a) Acklin Asphalt

Hot mix/ oil sand installation with a laydown machine.	\$9.95 per ton
--	----------------
  
  - (b) Lites Bros. Asphalt, Inc.

Hot mix/ oil sand installation with a laydown machine.	\$11.00 per ton
--	-----------------
  
4. **Cold Mix**
  - (a) Diamond B Construction Co. LLC

Cold Mix – FOB Alexandria Plant	\$83.00 per ton
Cold Mix – Delivered to Many, LA	\$98.00 per ton
  
  - (b) East Texas Asphalt Co. Ltd.

Cold Mix- FOB Center, TX Plant	\$78.00 per ton
Cold Mix- Delivered to Many, LA	\$90.20 per ton
Cold Mix- FOB Lufkin, TX Plant	\$75.00 per ton
Cold Mix- Delivered to Many, LA	\$89.20 per ton
Cold Mix- FOB Rebecca, TX Plant	\$80.00 per ton
Cold Mix- Delivered to Many, LA	\$89.20 per ton
Cold Mix- FOB Paxton, TX Plant	\$78.00 per ton
Cold Mix- Delivered to Many, LA	\$89.40 per ton
  
5. **One, Two, Three Course Gravel/ Road Oil Seal Application**  
No bid received.
  
6. **Milling of Selected Asphalted Roads**
  - (a) Lites Bros. Asphalt, Inc.

Milling	\$.45 per square yard
---------	-----------------------
  
7. **Milling and Compacting of Selected Parish Roads that were Previously Overlaid with Oil Sand**
  - (a) Lites Bros. Asphalt, Inc.

Milling and compaction	\$.49 per square yard
------------------------	-----------------------
  
8. **Road Oil**
  - (a) Bryan & Bryan Asphalt Road Oil Co., Inc.

Oil will be refined product and will meet the State of Texas Department of Highways 1993 standard specification item #300. All oil will be delivered per ton from Trinity Asphalt Ltd., Henderson Texas to any point in Sabine Parish. This bid is based on current posted prices, any increase or decrease in posted price shall be passed along to the Parish.	\$580.00 per ton
--	------------------
  
9. **Backhoe Services**
  - (a) Lites Bros. Asphalt, Inc.

Backhoe services	\$75.00 per hour
------------------	------------------
  
10. **Trackhoe Services**
  - (a) Lites Bros. Asphalt, Inc.

Trackhoe services – 320 Caterpillar	\$120.00 per hour
Trackhoe services – 315 Caterpillar	\$120.00 per hour
Trackhoe services – 304 Caterpillar	\$100.00 per hour
  
11. **Bulldozer Services**
  - (a) Lites Bros. Asphalt, Inc.

Bulldozer services – D-5 Caterpillar \$110.00 per hour  
 Bulldozer services – 550 John Deere \$110.00 per hour

**12. Material Hauling Services – 14-yard Dump Truck**

(a) Lites Bros. Asphalt, Inc.  
 Material hauling services- 14-yard  
 dump truck \$75.00 per hour

**13. Material Hauling Services – 24 Yard Belly Dump Truck**

No bid received.

**14. Creosote Lumber Timbers and Piling – (Class B)**

No bid received.

**15. Corrugated Steel Galvanized Plain Round Culverts and Bands**

(a) Family Farm & Garden  
 The price quoted is a delivered cost. Culverts are manufactured in the United States. Band prices are not bid. Prices are FOB delivered parish wide, at single culvert prices without any delivery charges.

(b) Coastal Culvert & Supply, Inc.  
 In accordance with Louisiana Preference Law, LRS 39:1595, the vendor is requesting a 10% preference for products manufactured in Louisiana. Band prices are not bid. Prices are FOB delivered parish wide, at single culvert prices without any delivery charges.

**Note: Culvert unit prices are for each foot of pipe.**

		Family Farm & Garden	Coastal Culvert & Supply, Inc.
		<u>Pipe</u>	<u>Pipe</u>
<u>2&amp;2/3 x 1/2 Corrugation</u>	<u>Gauge</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>
Galvanized:			
12"	16	\$9.96	\$10.35
15"	16	\$12.44	\$12.44
18"	16	\$14.88	\$15.75
21"	16	\$17.36	\$18.21
24"	16	\$19.80	\$19.88
24"	14	\$23.76	\$25.14
30"	16	\$24.80	\$25.11
30"	14	\$29.84	\$31.33
36"	14	\$35.72	\$37.07
42"	14	\$41.72	\$48.48
48"	14	\$47.72	\$57.22
Polymer Coated:			
12"	16	\$14.94	\$16.25
15"	16	\$18.66	\$19.50
18"	16	\$22.32	\$24.38
21"	16	\$26.04	\$27.63
24"	16	\$29.70	\$30.88
24"	14	\$35.64	\$38.11
30"	16	\$37.20	\$39.00
30"	14	\$44.76	\$48.75
36"	14	\$53.58	\$58.50
42"	14	\$62.58	\$69.77
48"	14	\$71.58	\$83.20
<u>3x1 Corrugation</u>			
Galvanized			
60"	16	\$58.88	\$65.95
60"	14	\$70.08	\$80.11
66"	16	\$60.00	\$76.55
66"	14	\$72.33	\$92.05
72"	14	\$84.72	\$100.57
84"	14	\$98.00	\$117.31
96"	12	\$151.32	\$182.75
108"	10	\$215.88	\$264.10
120"	10	\$239.88	\$302.22
132"	10	No Bid	No Bid
132"	8	No Bid	\$450.00

144"	10	No Bid	No Bid
144"	8	No Bid	\$550.00
Polymer Coated:			
60"	16	\$88.32	\$95.33
60"	14	\$105.12	\$116.13
66"	16	\$90.00	\$132.06
66"	14	\$108.50	\$133.61
72"	14	\$127.08	\$142.26
84"	14	\$147.00	\$169.72
96"	12	\$226.98	\$265.42
108"	10	\$323.82	\$380.98
120"	10	\$359.82	\$439.40
132"	8	No Bid	No Bid
144"	8	No Bid	No Bid

**16. Used Railroad Tank Shell Culverts**

(a) The Railroad Yard

Tanks are patched with bulk heads removed and wall thickness is .500w to .625w. All prices include delivery on company owned trucks which allow for rolling off the tank without the expense of hiring a crane to lift them off.

<u>Diameter</u>	<u>Length</u>	<u>Price Per Linear Foot</u>
8'6" – 10'3"	29.5' -39.9 feet	\$250.00 per linear foot
8'6" – 10'3"	40.0' – 49.9 feet	\$240.00 per linear foot
8'6" – 10'3"	50.0' – 75.0 feet	\$240.00 per linear foot

**17. Tires**

(a) Ark-La-Tex Discount Tire, LLC.

Tires listed are made in the USA as well as imported. Countries of origin for tires imported include Japan, Korea, China, and Indonesia.

Availability of tire brands, and especially models, regularly change in the tire manufacturing industry. Because of this, no guarantee can be made that a particular brand, model, etc., will be available at any given time, nor for how long. All prices and availability are subject to industry changes.

<u>Size</u>	<u>Brand/Tread</u>	<u>Ply Rating</u>	<u>Price</u>
LT225/75R16	Americus CLT	10	\$124.00
LT225/75R16	Americus AT	10	\$144.00
235/75R16	Maxxis Bravo HT	4	\$129.00
235/75R16	Hankook AT	XL	\$162.00
LT235/85R16	Ironman CHT	10	\$162.00
LT235/85R16	Wild Trail CTX MT	10	\$166.00
LT235/80R17	Multimile HRT	10	\$172.00
LT235/80R17	Wild Trail CTX MT	10	\$172.00
LT245/75R17	Americus CLT	10	\$149.00
LT245/75R17	Americus AT	10	\$156.00
LT265/75R16	Americus CLT	10	\$150.00
LT265/75R16	Americus AT	10	\$156.00
ST235/80R16	Super A DK688	10	\$100.00
ST205/75R15	Transeagle STII	8	\$90.00
7.50-16	Deestone D902	10	\$120.00
245/70R17	Americus CUV	4	\$122.00
245/70R17	Americus AT	4	\$143.00
265/70R17	Americus CUV	4	\$136.00
265/70R17	Americus AT	4	\$152.00
245/75R16	Ironman RB	4	\$129.00
245/75R16	Ironman AT	4	\$139.00
245/75R22.5	Sumitomo Steer	14	\$345.00
LT285/75R16	Americus AT	10	\$172.00
LT285/75R16	Americus MT	10	\$184.00
7.00-15	Deestone D902	8	\$96.00
17.5-25	Deestone D313	16	\$579.00
17.5R25	Dynamaxx E3/L3	2*Radial	\$1,081.00
10.00-16	Cropmax F-2	8	\$189.00
8.3-16	Traction Master R-1	6	\$249.00
14.9-24	Alliance 768 R-1	8	\$314.00
14.00R24	Boto G2/L2	2*Radial	\$899.00
16.0/70-20	Deestone D303	14	\$404.00
11L-16	Deestone D412 F-3	12	\$179.00
18.4-30	Maxdura 1360 R-1	10	\$579.00

460/85R34	Alliance 846 R-1	147A8/B	\$1,093.00
18.4-34	Alliance 324 R-1	8	\$639.00
12.5/80-18	Maxdura R-4	14	\$260.00
7.50-16	Cropmax F-2	8	\$142.50
9.5-24	AGstar R-1	8	\$199.00
19.5L-24	Maxdura R-4	12	\$504.00
16.9-30	AGstar R-1	8	\$495.00
11L-15	AGstar Rib Imp	12	\$134.00
11L-15	Deestone D412 F-3	12	\$163.00
20.5R25	BKT SR30 E3/L3	2*Radial	\$1,815.00
13.6-24	AGstar R-1	8	\$349.00
15.5-25	Alliance 307 G2/L2	12	\$504.00
15.5R25	Maxam MS300 E3/L3	2* Radial	\$1,119.00
14.9-28	Cropmax R-1	8	\$445.00
9.00R20	ECED BT168 (set)	14	\$306.50
10.00R20	Veerubber VT113	14	\$253.00
10.00R20	ECED BT168 hwy (set)	18	\$408.00
10.00R20	ECED BT118 grip (set)	18	\$395.00
425/65R22.5	Sumitomo ST720	20	\$657.00
11R24.5	Vitour Steer	16	\$355.00
11R24.5	Toyo Prem. Steer	14	\$425.00
11R24.5	Vitour Grip	16	\$375.00
295/75R22.5	Americus (hwy)	14	\$331.00
295/75R22.5	Cosmo CT708 (grip)	14	\$335.00
10R22.5	Americus (hwy)	14	\$315.00
10R22.5	Hankook (grip)	14	\$415.00
11R22.5	Americus Steer	14	\$325.00
11R22.5	Vitour CSD (grip)	16	\$345.00
13.00-24	Deestone D310 G2/L2	12	\$420.00
11.5/80-15.3	BKT	12	\$249.00

(b) Stewart's Auto Sales

All prices include mounting and balancing where applicable. All 10 ply and 12 ply tires are load range E and all 4 ply tires are load range C. No tires are included on a state contract.

Size	Brand/Tread	Ply Rating	Price
LT285/75R16	Nankang all terrain	10	\$159.50
LT225/75R16	Nankang-all terrain	10	\$129.00
LT225/75R16	Americus HT	10	\$122.00
235/75R16	Maxxis	4	\$108.00
235/75R16	Hankook AT	4	\$144.00
LT235/80R17	GT Radial HT	10	\$128.00
LT235/80R17	Nankang AT	10	\$138.00
LT245/75R17	GT Radial HT	10	\$125.00
LT245/75R17	Nankang AT	10	\$137.00
LT265/75R16	GT Radial HT	10	\$129.00
LT265/75R16	Nankang AT	10	\$138.00
LT265/75R16	Americus MT	10	\$145.00
LT285/75R16	Patagonia Mudgrip	10	\$176.00
245/70R17	Nankang AT	4	\$119.00
245/70R17	Americus HT	4	\$111.00
LT245/70R17	Americus all position	10	\$123.00
LT235/85R16	GT Radial HT	10	\$122.00
LT235/85R16	Mudstar Mud-Terrain	10	\$146.00
265/70R17	Nankang HT	4	\$122.00
265/70R17	Nankang AT	4	\$122.00
245/75R16	Milestar HT	4	\$117.00
245/75R16	Ironman AT	4	\$126.00
LT275/70R18	Nankang HT	10	\$154.00
LT275/70R18	Patagonia AT	10	\$159.00
7.50-16	Super A Trailer	10	\$94.00
7.50-16	Samson Trailer	14	\$117.00
235/80/16	Super A	10	\$91.00
7.00-15	Zeemax	10	\$88.00
205/75/15	Transmaster	8	\$65.00
LT224/75/16	Federal MT	10	\$140.00
LT235/80/17	Lion MT		\$154.00
LT245/75/17	Ironman MT		\$152.00

(c) Sabine Tire, Inc.

Vendor can also deliver Michelin, B F Goodrich, and Uniroyal tires on state contract prices. All tires will be mounted and balanced except tires that are bought on state contract prices.

Size	Brand/Tread	Ply Rating	Price
LT285/75R16	Summit Trail Climber AT	10	\$139.58
LT285/75R16	Mud Claw Extreme MT	10	\$155.45
LT225/75R16	Summit Trail Climber AT	10	\$113.70
LT225/75R16	Summit Trail Climber HT	10	\$117.64
LT235/75R16	Sumitomo Encounter HT	4	\$119.05
LT235/75R16	Cooper AT3 4S	4	\$139.00
LT235/85R16	Summit Trail Climber HT	10	\$119.81
LT235/85R16	Summit Trail Climber AT	10	\$123.10
LT235/85R16	Mud Claw Extreme MT	10	\$135.99
LT235/80R17	Summit Trail Climber AT	10	\$126.75
LT235/80R17	Summit Trail Climber HT	10	\$126.33
LT235/80R17	Mud Claw Extreme MT	10	\$147.57
LT245/75R17	Summit Trail Climber HT	10	\$126.20
LT245/75R17	Summit Trail Climber AT	10	\$131.18
LT245/75R17	Mud Claw Extreme MT	10	\$147.64
LT265/75R16	Summit Trail Climber AT	10	\$132.82
LT265/75R16	Summit Trail Climber HT	10	\$128.75
LT265/75R16	Mud Claw Extreme MT	10	\$137.00
245/70R17	Summit Trail Climber HT	4	\$109.10
265/70R17	Summit Trail Climber HT	4	\$118.58
265/70R17	Summit Trail Climber AT	4	\$119.60
265/70R17	Mud Claw Extreme MT	10	\$137.85
245/75R16	Summit Trail Climber HT	10	\$119.23
245/75R16	Summit Trail Climber AT	10	\$121.22
235/85R16	Mud Claw Extreme MT	10	\$135.99
275/70R18	Summit Trail Climber AT	10	\$156.04
275/70R18	Cooper Discoverer HT3	10	\$199.32
750x16	PowerKing Super Hwy		\$113.72
235/80R16	Trail King RST		\$79.53
700-15	Power King Super Hwy		\$88.65
900R20	Sailun S811	14	\$293.08
ST205/75R15	Trail King ST		\$58.09
245/75R22.5	Sumitomo ST 719		\$292.42
295/75R22.5	Mile Pro Steer		\$307.84
11R22.5	Road X Hwy Steer	16	\$294.54
11R22.5	Road X CSD Grip	16	\$297.60
11R24.5	Road X CSD Grip	16	\$338.94
11R24.5	Road X Hwy Steer	16	\$330.94
10R22.5	Sumitomo ST 727 Hwy		\$298.95
425/65R22.5	Sumitomo ST 720	20	\$599.50
295/75R22.5	Mile Pro MP608 CSD		\$308.37
17.5R25	Power King XERT3 Loader	Radial	\$903.21
17.5X25	Power King Loader L2	12	\$595.00
1000X16	Petlas Tri Rib	8	\$134.34
1400X24	BKT Grader		\$1,050.00
11LX16	Harvest King Premium Backhoe F3	10	\$137.06
11.5/80-15.3	ATF 4403 Euro Rib	12	\$206.50
11L-15	Harvest King Backhoe F3	10	\$128.05
20.5R25	Power King XERT 3 Loader 2		\$1,595.00
9.5X24	Firestone Super All Traction Tubeless		\$230.00
9.5X24	Petlas R-1		\$168.00
1000R20	Sumitomo Hwy	16	\$345.00
1000R20	Sumitomo Grip	16	\$395.00
15.5R25	Power King XERT 3 loader	Radial	\$795.00
15.5X25	Power King Loader	12	\$495.00
8.3-16	OTC Trac Master		\$260.00
14.9R24	Petlas R-1	6	\$303.17
16.0/70R20	BKT MP567		\$542.62
18.4X30	Petlas R-1	8	\$490.43
460/85R34	BKT R1-RT855		\$845.00
18.4X34	Petlas R-1	8	\$525.90
12.5/80-18	Harvest King Power Lug R-4		\$263.24
750X16	Petlas Tri Rib		\$87.21
16.9X30	Petlas R-1	8	\$440.40
11LX15	Harvest King Tri Rib	8	\$123.30
14.9X28	Petlas R-1		\$364.89
19.5LX24	Petlas R-4 Industrial Lug	12	\$476.61

13.6X24	Pertlas R-1	8	\$298.51
1300X24	Power King Loader L2		\$390.36

(d) Mark's Wholesale Tires

LT285/75R16	Atturo Trail Blade A/T	10	\$159.00
LT285/75R16	Toyo Open Country HT2 Hwy	10	\$215.00
LT285/75R16	Americus Rugged MT (Grip)	10	\$165.00
LT285/75R16	Firestone Destination MT2 (Grip)	10	\$275.00
LT225/75R16	Atturo Trail Blade A/T	10	\$125.00
LT225/75R16	Westlake SL309 Hwy	10	\$129.00
LT225/75R16	Firestone Transforce HT2 Hwy	10	\$179.00
LT225/75R16	Firestone Transforce AT2	10	\$199.00
P235/75R16	Westlake SL318 Hwy	4	\$125.00
P235/75R16	Westlake SL369 AT	4	\$129.00
LT235/80R17	Firestone Transforce HT2 Hwy	10	\$199.00
LT235/80R17	Firestone Transforce AT2	10	\$199.00
LT235/80R17	Westlake SL309 Hwy	10	\$145.00
LT 235/80R17	Ironman All Country A/T	10	\$159.00
LT245/75R17	Firestone Transforce HT2 Hwy	10	\$199.00
LT245/75R17	Firestone Transforce AT2	10	\$225.00
LT245/75R17	Westlake SL309 Hwy	10	\$139.00
LT245/75R17	Westlake SL369 AT	10	\$159.00
LT265/75R16	Firestone Transforce HT2 Hwy	10	\$195.00
LT265/75R16	Firestone Transforce AT2	10	\$209.00
LT265/75R16	Westlake SL309 Hwy	10	\$149.00
LT265/75R16	Westlake SL369 AT	10	\$159.00
P245/70R17	Westlake SL309 Hwy	4	\$129.00
P245/70R17	Westlake SL369 AT	4	\$135.00
P245/70R17	General HTS60 Hwy	4	\$169.00
P245/70R17	Toyo Open Country AT2	4	\$179.00
P265/70R17	Toyo Open Country HT2 Hwy	4	\$179.00
P265/70R17	Toyo Open Country AT2	4	\$179.00
P265/70R17	Westlake SL309 Hwy	4	\$129.00
P265/70R17	Westlake SL369 AT	4	\$139.00
P245/75R16	Westlake SL309 Hwy	4	\$129.00
P245/75R16	Westlake SL369 AT	4	\$139.00
P245/75R16	Toyo Open Country HT2	4	\$179.00
P245/75R16	Toyo Open Country AT2	4	\$189.00
LT235/85R16	Americus Rugged MT (Grip)	10	\$159.00
LT235/85R16	Toyo Open Country MT	10	\$239.00
LT275/70R18	Westlake SL369 AT	10	\$169.00
LT275/70R18	Firestone Transforce HT2 Hwy	10	\$229.00
LT275/70R18	Firestone Transforce AT2	10	\$259.00
7.50-16	Deestone	10	\$119.00
235/80R16	Zenna	10	\$105.00
7.00-15	Deestone	10	\$99.00
205/75R15	Transeagle	8	\$89.00
245/75R22.5	Toyo M154 Steer	14	\$329.00
295/75R22.5	China Steer	16	\$299.00
295/75R22.5	China Grip	16	\$299.00
295/75R22.5	Toyo M154 Steer	14	\$389.00
295/75R22.5	Toyo Drive Grip	14	\$389.00
11R22.5	China Steer	14	\$299.00
11R22.5	China Drive Grip	14	\$299.00
11R22.5	Toyo M154Steer	14	\$399.00
11R22.5	Toyo Drive Grip	14	\$399.00
11R24.5	China Steer	14	\$309.00
11R24.5	China Drive Grip	14	\$315.00
11R24.5	Toyo M154 Steer	14	\$399.00
11R24.5	General Drive Grip	14	\$389.00
425/65R22.5	Hercules H402 All Position	20	\$550.00
17.5R25	Maxam	20	\$1,500.00
10.00-16	Crop Max Tri Rib	8	\$159.00
14.00R24	Galaxy	1*Radial	\$795.00
11L-16	Deestone F-3	12	\$159.00
11L-15	Deestone F3	12	\$149.00
20.5R25	Titan	2*Radial	\$1,850.00
9.5-24	Galaxy R1	6	\$199.00
15.5R25	Maxam	2*Radial	\$1,150.00
15.5-25	Deestone	12	\$750.00
8.3-16	OTR	6	\$199.00

14.9-24	Alliance R1	8	\$259.00
18.4-30	Maxdura R1	10	\$535.00
460/85R34	Alliance R1	Radial	\$950.00
18.4-34	Alliance R1	8	\$599.00
12.5-80/18	Deestone R4	12	\$249.00
7.50-16	Crop Max Tri Rib	8	\$129.00
16.9-30	Crop Max R1	8	\$499.00
11L-15	Crop Max Imp	12	\$129.00
14.9-28	Crop Max R1	8	\$359.00
19.5L24	Maxdura R4	12	\$475.00
13.6-24	AG Star	8	\$259.00
13.00-24	Deestone	12	\$349.00

**18. Gravel and Crushed Rock**

**18(a). Gravel Oversize**

No bid received.

**18(b) Gravel Oversize Maintenance**

(a) Larry Grayson & Son Trucking, LLC

Oversized Maintenance Gravel:

Delivered:

Florien	\$32.00 per ton
Many	\$32.00 per ton
Pleasant Hill	\$33.00 per ton
Zwolle	\$33.00 per ton

**18(c) Gravel Graded Oversize Maintenance**

No bid received.

**18(d) Gravel – Maintenance**

(a) Larry Grayson & Son Trucking, LLC

Maintenance Gravel:

Delivered:

Florien	\$29.00 per ton
Many	\$29.00 per ton
Pleasant Hill	\$30.00 per ton
Zwolle	\$30.00 per ton

**18(e) Gravel C1**

(a) Prairie Contractors, LLC.

Gravel – 57's size (Concrete Size- C1)

FOB Plant- Leesville, LA

\$34.50 per ton

**18(f) Gravel C-2**

No bid received.

**18(g) Gravel C3**

(a) Larry Grayson & Son Trucking, LLC

C-3 Gravel:

Delivered:

Florien	\$29.00 per ton
Many	\$29.00 per ton
Pleasant Hill	\$30.00 per ton
Zwolle	\$30.00 per ton

(b) Prairie Contractors, LLC.

Pea gravel-(Size – C-3)

FOB Plant- Leesville, LA

\$32.50 per ton

(c) East Texas Asphalt Co., LTD

Pea gravel:

FOB Plant- Paxton, TX

Delivered -

\$41.00 per ton

\$52.40 per ton

**18(h) Crushed Rock-Glauconite – (Black Rock)**

(a) Big 4, Inc.

Road Base:

FOB Plant- Hemphill, TX

\$10.00 per ton

\$12.00 per cubic  
yard

Filter Rock 2" x 4":

FOB Plant- Hemphill, TX

\$16.50 per ton

	\$16.50 per cubic yard
Rock 3" x 5": FOB Plant – Hemphill, TX	\$16.50 per ton \$16.50 per cubic yard
Rip Rap: FOB Plant – Hemphill, TX	\$18.50 per ton \$18.50 per cubic yard
<b>18(i) Winn Rock</b>	
(a) <u>Winn Rock LLC</u> Crushed stone (Winn Rock) SB-2 Stone 2 ½ top size with 0-25% passing #4 screen FOB Winnfield, LA	\$19.00 per ton
Base course stone 6" top size with 0-25% Passing #4 screen – FOB Winnfield, LA	\$19.50 per ton
Screenings – FOB Winnfield, LA	\$ 9.80 per ton
<b>18(j) Limestone – Super Flex Base</b>	
(a) <u>East Texas Asphalt Co., LTD</u> <b>Limestone Base:</b> FOB Plant- Paxton, TX Delivered -	\$28.50 per ton \$39.90 per ton
FOB Plant – Rebecca, TX Delivered	\$28.50 per ton \$37.00 per ton
FOB Plant – Lufkin, TX Delivered	\$28.50 per ton \$42.70 per ton
<b>SB 2 Base:</b> FOB Plant- Paxton, TX Delivered -	\$32.00 per ton \$43.40 per ton
FOB Plant- Lufkin, TX Delivered -	\$32.00 per ton \$46.20 per ton
(b) <u>Apeck Aggregates Supply, LLC</u> Standard Base: FOB Plant- Deridder, LA FOB Plant – Leesville, LA	\$26.86 per ton \$28.86 per ton
<b>18(k) Limestone- #57 – 1 ½ "Stone</b>	
(a) <u>Larry Grayson &amp; Son Trucking, LLC</u> #57 Limestone: Delivered:	
Florien	\$43.00 per ton
Many	\$43.00 per ton
Pleasant Hill	\$43.00 per ton
Zwolle	\$43.00 per ton
(b) <u>Madden Contracting Company, LLC.</u> #57 Stone FOB Plant – Mansfield, LA FOB Plant- Natchitoches, LA	\$37.00 per ton \$35.00 per ton
(c) <u>East Texas Asphalt Co., LTD</u> #57 Stone FOB Paxton Delivered	\$33.00 per ton \$44.40 per ton
FOB Rebecca Delivered	\$33.75 per ton \$42.25 per ton
(d) <u>Apeck Aggregates Supply, LLC</u> #57 Stone – 1 ½ Stone FOB Plant- Deridder, LA	\$29.79 per ton

<b>18(l) Limestone #67 – 1” Stone</b>	
(a) <u>Madden Contracting Company, LLC.</u>	
#67 Stone:	
FOB Plant – Mansfield, LA	\$37.00 per ton
FOB Plant- Natchitoches, LA	\$35.00 per ton
<b>18(m) Limestone Rip Rap – 1”-12”</b>	
(a) <u>Madden Contracting Company, LLC</u>	
Any Rip Rap	
FOB Plant:	
Mansfield, LA	\$43.00 per ton
Natchitoches, LA	\$41.75 per ton
(b) <u>East Texas Asphalt Co., LTD</u>	
Rip Rap -12”	
FOB – Plant – Paxton, TX	\$45.50 per ton
Delivered –	\$57.90 per ton
FOB – Plant – Rebecca, TX	
Delivered –	\$39.50 per ton
Rip Rap – 18”-24”-36”	
FOB – Plant – Paxton, TX	\$58.00 per ton
Delivered –	\$72.40 per ton
(c) <u>Apeck Aggregates Supply, LLC</u>	
1”x12” Rip Rap	
FOB Plant- Deridder, LA	\$30.18 per ton
<b>18(n) Limestone #8 – ½ “Stone for Chip Seal</b>	
(a) <u>Apeck Aggregates Supply, LLC</u>	
#8 Stone ½”	
FOB Plant- Deridder, LA	\$34.60 per ton
<b>18(o) Limestone 3” x 5” Stone</b>	
(a) <u>Madden Contracting Company, LLC</u>	
B Stone	
FOB Plant:	
Mansfield, LA	\$32.25 per ton
Natchitoches, LA	\$31.75 per ton
(b) <u>East Texas Asphalt Co., LTD</u>	
1” x 3” or 3”x5” Stone	
FOB – Plant – Paxton, TX	\$39.50 per ton
Delivered -	\$50.90 per ton
FOB – Plant – Rebecca	
Delivered -	\$39.50 per ton
Delivered -	
Delivered -	
(c) <u>Apeck Aggregates Supply, LLC</u>	
3” x 5” Stone	
FOB Plant- Deridder, LA	\$29.67 per ton
<b>18(p) Crushed Arkansas Rock/ Rhyolite</b>	
(a) <u>Prairie Contractors, LLC.</u>	
Road Base- crushed rhyolite stone:	
FOB Plant- Leesville, LA	\$29.00 per ton
ASTM Number 57’s,67’s and 8s-	
Crushed rhyolite stone:	
FOB Plant- Leesville, LA	\$32.50 per ton
5” x 0 Surge Rock and 2 ½ x 0 Ballasts	
Rhyolite crushed stone “Surge”	
FOB Plant- Leesville, LA	\$33.50 per ton
LA 610 Base	
Rhyolite crushed stone roadbase	
FOB Plant- Leesville, LA	\$33.00 per ton
(b) <u>Madden Contracting Company, LLC.</u>	
LA 610 Base	
FOB Plant:	
Mansfield, LA	\$31.25 per ton
Natchitoches, LA	\$29.75 per ton

Class 7 Base	
FOB Plant:	
Mansfield, LA	\$31.00 per ton
Natchitoches, LA	\$29.50 per ton
1 ½ “Base	
FOB Plant:	
Mansfield, LA	\$29.25 per ton
Natchitoches, LA	\$28.00 per ton
3” Base	
FOB Plant:	
Mansfield, LA	\$32.50 per ton
Natchitoches, LA	\$31.50 per ton

The Jury will schedule a workshop prior to the regular December meeting to review and compare bids.

Resolution No. 8422

Motion by Ruffin and seconded by Garcie to take the materials, supplies, and services bids for 2020 under advisement until the regularly scheduled December 18, 2019 Police Jury meeting with the bid awards to be made at that time (said bids opened on November 6, 2019 at 10:00 a.m.)

This resolution having been submitted to a vote; the vote thereon was as follows:

Yeas: 9 - Funderburk, McCormic, Ruffin, Bison, Brown, Garcie, Sepulvado, Ebarb, and Byrd

Nays: 0

Abstain: 0

Absent: 0

19. Set Date and Time for Public Hearing on Proposed Budget for Fiscal Year Ended December 31, 2020

Louisiana Revised Statute 39:1307(A) requires a police jury with total expenditures of \$500,000 or more from general fund and any special revenue funds to afford the public an opportunity to participate in the budget process prior to adoption of the budget.

The Sabine Parish Police Jury will adopt its 2020 Budget at its regularly scheduled meeting which will be held at 9:00 a.m. on Wednesday, December 18, 2019.

Resolution No. 8423

Motion by Ebarb and seconded by Byrd to hold a public hearing on the 2020 Budget in the Police Jury Meeting Room in the Courthouse located at 400 S. Capitol Street, Room 101, Many, Louisiana, on December 18, 2019 at 8:30 a.m.

This resolution having been submitted to a vote; the vote thereon was as follows:

Yeas: 9 - Funderburk, McCormic, Ruffin, Bison, Brown, Garcie, Sepulvado, Ebarb, and Byrd

Nays: 0

Abstain: 0

Absent: 0

20. Parish Transportation Act Priority List (3 Years – 2020,2021, 2022)- Reminder Only

Jurors were reminded the Jury needs to adopt a three (3) year Parish Transportation Act Priority List for roads for the years 2020, 2021, and 2022. This must be done prior to January 1, 2020 in order to comply with the Parish Transportation Act.

21. Authorize Payment of Approved Bills

Resolution No. 8424

Motion by Ruffin and seconded by Brown to pay the approved bills.

This resolution having been submitted to a vote; the vote thereon was as follows:

Yeas: 9 - Funderburk, McCormic, Ruffin, Bison, Brown, Garcie, Sepulvado, Ebarb, and Byrd

Nays: 0

Abstain: 0

Absent: 0

22. Appropriate Sales Tax for November Operations (\$230,000)

Resolution No. 8425

Motion by Ruffin and seconded by Garcie to appropriate and transfer \$230,000.00 from the Sales Tax Fund to the Parish-wide Transportation Fund for November 2019 operations.

This resolution having been submitted to a vote; the vote thereon was as follows:

Yeas: 9 - Funderburk, McCormic, Ruffin, Bison, Brown, Garcie, Sepulvado, Ebarb, and Byrd

Nays: 0

Abstain: 0

Absent: 0

Mr. Funderburk left the meeting at this time.

23. Committee Reports

Road and Shop Committee:

Mr. Sepulvado, Chairman of the Road and Shop Committee, reported to the police jury that the Committee recommends the purchase of a new dump truck to be used on a parish-wide basis and the hiring of an additional truck driver to operate the vehicle. He requested that this matter be referred to the finance committee for review and approval.

Resolution No. 8426

Motion by McCormic and seconded by Ebarb to authorize the Finance Committee to review and approve the purchase of a parish-wide dump truck and the hiring of an additional truck driver.

This resolution having been submitted to a vote; the vote thereon was as follows:

Yeas: 8 - McCormic, Ruffin, Bison, Brown, Garcie, Sepulvado, Ebarb, and Byrd

Nays: 0

Abstain: 0

Absent: 1 - Funderburk

Mr. Sepulvado then discussed the possible abandonment of Brandon Road. He noted that correspondence had been mailed to all landowners on Brandon Road requesting input concerning the proposed abandonment. Four responses were received, two of which were opposed to the abandonment of the road.

Mr. Garcie informed the Jury that only a portion of Brandon Road was being considered for abandonment and that only landowners along that section of the road should have been contacted.

Resolution No. 8427

Motion by Sepulvado and seconded by Byrd to table consideration of the abandonment of Brandon Road until the December regular meeting.

This resolution having been submitted to a vote; the vote thereon was as follows:

Yeas: 7 - McCormic, Ruffin, Bison, Brown, Garcie, Sepulvado, and Byrd

Nays: 0

Abstain: 1 - Ebarb

Absent: 1 - Funderburk

Mr. Sepulvado then opened discussion on Levander Road, Fredrick Road, and Hubert Road located in Ward 3, Road District 9 and Springwood Ridge Road located in Ward 5, Road District 15.

He noted that Hubert Road, Springwood Ridge Road, and Fredrick Road have been maintained for many years by the Police Jury but have not been added to the parish-wide road system. Mr. McCormic stated that the length of Levander Road needs to be corrected to a distance of 2,910 linear feet.

Resolution No. 8428

Motion by McCormic and seconded by Byrd to adopt Hubert Road and Fredrick Road, located in Ward 3, Road District 9, and Springwood Ridge Road, located in Ward 5, Road District 15, into the parish-wide road system; and to correct the recorded length of Levander Road to 2,910 linear feet.

This resolution having been submitted to a vote; the vote thereon was as follows:

Yeas: 8 - McCormic, Ruffin, Bison, Brown, Garcie, Ebarb, Sepulvado, and Byrd

Nays: 0

Abstain: 0

Absent: 1 - Funderburk

Mr. Byrd left the meeting at this time.

#### 24. Operations

President Bison briefly discussed the progress in resuming operation of the solid waste landfill.

He also discussed Lyddy Turnpike. The Police Jury recently paid the State of Louisiana Department of Transportation and Development \$25,000 in matching funds for the installation of a new railroad crossing with cross-arms.

25. Adjournment

Resolution No. 8429

Motion by Ruffin and seconded by Ebarb to adjourn.

This resolution having been submitted to a vote; the vote thereon was as follows:

Yeas: 7 - McCormic, Ruffin, Bison, Brown, Garcie, Sepulvado, and Ebarb

Nays: 0

Abstain: 0

Absent: 2 - Funderburk and Byrd

s/William E. Weatherford  
William E. Weatherford  
Secretary Treasurer

s/Ronald L. Bison  
Ronald L. Bison  
President